
 
 

 
 

CE MARK POLICY 
 

 
CE marking indicates a product’s compliance with EU legislation and so enables the 
free movement of products within the European market. By affixing the CE marking to 
a product, a manufacturer declares that the product satisfies the applicable legislative 
requirements enabling it to be sold. 
NB: Not all products must bear the CE marking - only product categories mentioned in 
specific EU directives. 
 
The CE Mark provides assurance that the manufacturer has verified that the product 
complies with all relevant essential requirements laid down in the applicable 
directive(s) and if stipulated in the directive(s), had it examined by an independent 
conformity assessment body. 
 
Allfix Ltd believe the CE Marking Directives and the policies the company have 
adopted is an excellent way to strengthen relationships with our customers and to 
ensure the safer use of the products we distribute. 

 
It is the manufacturer’s responsibility to carry out the conformity assessment, to set up 
the technical file, to issue the declaration of conformity and to affix the CE marking.  

 
As a distributor, Allfix Limited will, where requested, conduct checks to ensure that 
requisite products bear the CE marking and the supporting documentation is in order. 
 
Our ISO:9001:2008 certified Quality Management System is formatted to ensure that 
in those instances where a customer informs the company, in writing, of their need to 
receive CE marked goods, systems are in place at the order processing/contract 
review stage to ensure such items are compliant. 

Allfix Limited is not in the position to give legally binding information and any 
information you receive is what the OEM/Supplier has provided to us. As such, we 
cannot accept liability for financial losses (indemnity, loss of profit) or civil penalties 
caused by official ruling.  

Allfix Limited will continually review directives and can assure all our customers 
compliance  in the controls process currently adopted.  

 
This policy will be regularly reviewed by the Directors and amended and updated as 
and when necessary.   

 
Martin Wild – Safety & Quality Director 

 



 
 


